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This study provides a detailed, in-depth analysis of a single incident rooted in the effort of a group of
professional employees to serve the public welfare It reveals in microcosm the interplay of political forces,
economic interests, personal ambition, organizational structure, and professional ethics that culminated in an
act of whistle-blowing. The incident took place during the final construction phase of the Bay Area Rapid
Transit System (BART), designed to be America's first attempt at space-age mass transportation. Three
BART engineers, convinced of the lack of responsiveness of management to their concerns about the
system's safety, were fired for insubordination and other organizational sins. Based upon repeated interviews
with the engineers, with BART managers and directors, and with the professional societies involved, as well
as upon an extensive body of documents and court depositions, legislative reports, media reports, and
institutional memoranda. Divided Loyalties sets a theoretical context for the issues, traces the incident from
its beginning, examines the aftermath of the engineers' dismissal, and concludes with a set of
recommendations that should be considered by public and private organizations, professional associations,
agencies of government, and individual professional employees.
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From reader reviews:

Sandra Snyder:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading practice
give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book that improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want truly feel happy read
one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual Divided Loyalties: Whistle-Blowing at
BART (Science and Society; V. 4) is kind of book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Vanessa McGinty:

The book untitled Divided Loyalties: Whistle-Blowing at BART (Science and Society; V. 4) contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to
implement all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous
author. The author provides you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can
please read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice examine.

Joan Davis:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
right now there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading through is not important,
boring in addition to can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very
important for you personally. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for.
Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Divided Loyalties: Whistle-
Blowing at BART (Science and Society; V. 4) can make you experience more interested to read.

Katrina Scofield:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or descriptive from each source which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the Divided Loyalties: Whistle-Blowing at BART (Science and Society; V. 4) when you
required it?
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