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A profound investigation into the shifting nature of identity and reality

• Looks at the ways thought is embodied and how it takes on a life of its own

• Shows how Superman, an archetype of popular culture, is a perfect example of the nonlocality of quantum
physics

Writer Alvin Schwartz received a great deal of attention from fans when he began talking publicly about his
seventeen-year stint writing Superman and Batman comics. One of the individuals who contacted him was
no ordinary fan, but a seven-foot Buddhist monk named Thongden, a tulpa or individual who was thought
into being by a Tibetan mystic. Thongden put Alvin Schwartz on the path without form, an amazing journey
he took in the company of Hawaiian kahunas, quantum physicists, and superheroes. Superman, as it turns
out, is also a tulpa, a being created by thought that takes on a life of its own and, in Mr. Schwartz’s words, is
an archetype expressing the sense of nonlocality that is always present in the back of our minds--that
capacity to be everywhere instantly. Superman is one of the specific forms that embodies our reality when
we’re at our highest point, when we’re truly impermeable, indestructible, totally concentrated, and living
entirely in the now, a condition each of us actually attains from time to time.

Alvin Schwartz’s story is a personal journey through a lifelong remembrance of synchrony, inspiration,
accident, and magic. As it unfolds it puts into vivid clarity the saving grace that inhabits every moment of
our lives. The author travels as a stranger in a strange land, whose greatest oddity is that this land is our own.
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From reader reviews:

Alberta Smith:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the world,
the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book An Unlikely Prophet: A
Metaphysical Memoir by the Legendary Writer of Superman and Batman. All type of book can you see on
many sources. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Allan Kean:

The experience that you get from An Unlikely Prophet: A Metaphysical Memoir by the Legendary Writer of
Superman and Batman is a more deep you rooting the information that hide inside words the more you get
considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be aware of but An Unlikely Prophet: A
Metaphysical Memoir by the Legendary Writer of Superman and Batman giving you excitement feeling of
reading. The writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the
idea because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your current
vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We recommend you for having this kind of An Unlikely Prophet: A Metaphysical Memoir by the
Legendary Writer of Superman and Batman instantly.

Dorothy Walker:

This book untitled An Unlikely Prophet: A Metaphysical Memoir by the Legendary Writer of Superman and
Batman to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read
this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail
store or you can order it by using online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more
easily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for your
requirements to past this e-book from your list.

William Looney:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic inside park.
They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the book untitled An Unlikely Prophet: A Metaphysical Memoir by the
Legendary Writer of Superman and Batman can be very good book to read. May be it can be best activity to
you.
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