
Chicago Gardens: The Early History (Center for
American Places - Center Books on American

Places)
Cathy Jean Maloney

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=B007JQIBH2
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=B007JQIBH2
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=B007JQIBH2


Chicago Gardens: The Early History (Center for American
Places - Center Books on American Places)

Cathy Jean Maloney

Chicago Gardens: The Early History (Center for American Places - Center Books on American
Places) Cathy Jean Maloney

Once maligned as a swampy outpost, the fledgling city of Chicago brazenly adopted the motto Urbs in Horto
or City in a Garden, in 1837. Chicago Gardens shows how this upstart town earned its sobriquet over the
next century, from the first vegetable plots at Fort Dearborn to innovative garden designs at the 1933
World’s Fair.

            Cathy Jean Maloney has spent decades researching the city’s horticultural heritage, and here she
reveals the unusual history of Chicago’s first gardens. Challenged by the region’s clay soil, harsh winters,
and fierce winds, Chicago’s pioneering horticulturalists, Maloney demonstrates, found imaginative uses for
hardy prairie plants. This same creative spirit thrived in the city’s local fruit and vegetable markets,
encouraging the growth of what would become the nation’s produce hub. The vast plains that surrounded
Chicago, meanwhile, inspired early landscape architects, such as Frederick Law Olmsted, Jens Jensen, and
O.C. Simonds, to new heights of grandeur.  

            Maloney does not forget the backyard gardeners: immigrants who cultivated treasured seeds and
pioneers who planted native wildflowers. Maloney’s vibrant depictions of Chicagoans like “Bouquet Mary,”
a flower peddler who built a greenhouse empire, add charming anecdotal evidence to her argument–that
Chicago’s garden history rivals that of New York or London and ensures its status as a world-class capital of
horticultural innovation.      

            With exquisite archival photographs, prints, and postcards, as well as field guide descriptions of
living legacy gardens for today’s visitors, Chicago Gardens will delight green-thumbs from all parts of the
world.

Please note: The digital edition does not include 2 of the 177 images that appear in the physical edition.
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From reader reviews:

Julian Loredo:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of Chicago Gardens: The
Early History (Center for American Places - Center Books on American Places) book as basic and daily
reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Melissa Conner:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to a
person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Chicago Gardens: The Early History (Center
for American Places - Center Books on American Places) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up
with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Judy Finley:

You may get this Chicago Gardens: The Early History (Center for American Places - Center Books on
American Places) by browse the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve
difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only simply by
written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you
just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to
get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge
are still up-date. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Brenda Cornell:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book was rare? Why so many
issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes examining, not only
science book but in addition novel and Chicago Gardens: The Early History (Center for American Places -
Center Books on American Places) or maybe others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know
how the fantastic a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher
or perhaps students especially. Those books are helping them to add their knowledge. In some other case,
beside science book, any other book likes Chicago Gardens: The Early History (Center for American Places -
Center Books on American Places) to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book
like this.
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