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In this haunting and richly imagined dual-narrative tale that echoes the eerie mystery of Rebecca and The
Little Stranger, two women of very different eras are united by the secrets hidden within the walls of an
English manor house.

In 1933, naive twenty-two year-old Alice—pregnant and unmarried—is in disgrace. Her mother banishes her
from London to secluded Fiercombe Manor in rural Gloucestershire, where she can hide under the watchful
eye of her mother’s old friend, the housekeeper Mrs. Jelphs. The manor’s owners, the Stantons, live abroad,
and with her cover story of a recently-deceased husband Alice can have her baby there before giving it up for
adoption and returning home. But as Alice endures the long, hot summer at Fiercombe awaiting the baby’s
birth, she senses that something is amiss with the house and its absentee owners.

Thirty years earlier, pregnant Lady Elizabeth Stanton desperately hopes for the heir her husband desires.
Tormented by the memory of what happened after the birth of her first child, a daughter, she grows
increasingly terrified that history will repeat itself, with devastating consequences.

After meeting Tom, the young scion of the Stanton family, Alice becomes determined to uncover the clan’s
tragic past and exorcise the ghosts of this idyllic, isolated house. But nothing can prepare Alice for what she
uncovers. Soon it is her turn to fear: can she escape the tragic fate of the other women who have lived in the
Fiercombe valley . . .
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From reader reviews:

Benjamin Chambers:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider any time those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable
resource then you buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Fiercombe Manor as the daily resource information.

Geraldine Bagley:

This Fiercombe Manor is great reserve for you because the content which can be full of information for you
who all always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it
details accurately using great organize word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside. So if you are
read that hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward
sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Fiercombe Manor in your
hand like finding the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no e-book that
offer you world inside ten or fifteen small right but this reserve already do that. So , this can be good reading
book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt this?

Carla Heyward:

You can find this Fiercombe Manor by check out the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it may
to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not
only by simply written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern
era just like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right
now, choose your ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to
make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

James Pitts:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you also
know that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book. Many kinds of books
that can you go onto be your object. One of them is Fiercombe Manor.
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